HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 247

FRAOT TWRHR
G dAT fa= faHeT

SferRgET
faia 3 w13, 2021

T PlodMo 22 /Bodlo 67 /1957 /8o 15 TAT 23 T /2021.— W@H R @il ([Aemr iR fafre=)
AW, 1957 (1957 &1 Bl JRAFTIA 67) & URT 15 B IUIRT (1) TAT &RT 23 T §RT U fddal &7
TN &R gU, SRATT & ISAUT, $9d gRI, SRAVN g Wirel RId, @fel werfd, uRkasd iR afde
@ faRvr 99, 2012 @1 T ARG B & fog f=ferRad fem qemar €, srfq —

1. (1) 3 Frm R ag @frer Rarga, @fesn wIifd, uRaed R e @=e Farer () Fr=E,
2021 BT ST A& 2 |

2 3 frm Ioed § g gerE @ [ @ ang g
2. BRI g @il RIrma, @ie weIfe, uRkdesd 3R dg T+ Farer 799, 2012 (B2, 394, s9
q1e, Sad g\ der T B) H, W 9 #, Su—fm (3) H -

(i) 25 Ufera@” 3k dAT Wex & AN WR, 10 U’ 3 dAT Wex UfcrRenfua favam S,

(i) @R H, 125 /— WUY' TAT 15625,/— WUY AdI, fUEAl qOT TRl & WM W, HAM:

"110 /— SV TAT 121 /— HUY" 3fh, faga qen veg uforenfua by Sme |

3. S oAl |, | 18 ¥, A dfad |, d s Rl & W W, Tl Uolied 16 R /AT 53
@ ARIH A S U=l B SHGI veg g fuge ufoRenfud fahw S |

4. S Al ¥, M 20 @ e R, FEfaRed Frem aforenfia fear s, st —

"20 (1) uccwEN frEfeRad wd @ oued| adeT U @R gy, Sl 1 PR B, USc Pl FHYOT
PR FHT T ueeEny 4—

() dee H O W BRIAE v PR 4 T
(i) ucer fior & AR JAT UM Saure favol uvqa wR & g

(i) Polvex 7, R e URqd fHar 1 B, @ 9 9% Sad USe @ AgS 9l
dffed < & T | FrEd Rid @ TR ISR | 991a] THo—ud (TF S )
TR AR QT g qer

(iv) omded @ UG & T TR SIS B & w9 § R &) R TP A & AR
ATCH & AHGET RN TAT HaT & R

R el T W B AMS W, Ife gec b WY & forg arde yed S 9 15 RiawR
qdh DI A & IR UG HAT AT 8, A1 U<el IR Ifded & WRIfT & 9877 W & 419 &
3rfard e, ST AN B, & HGE WIS BT S SR & ol TR 81T |

2) Yee & ol Wt &5 @ qAdvr & fog &g Al AT IB FHRA AFg TE BRI |

@) frewe TF T & +iar Tl SRy WaR & &1 A uIRd & | afe &g ofa gfaa
&1 fpar Sirar €, @ |HYT & oY 3fded, JATded $I Ui @l A faT @1 it uR wied fdhar war || s
ST | |
5.  Sad Al H, e 22 |, Su—f (2) #, TN v & R R, g vres foRenfid fahar S |
6. Sad Al #, | 24 #, Su—fm (1) # wEE 9fder & Fdie}e & o endes @ fEfaRad @
| H We UGN @1 |gite R i fear sor” el @ W W, eEfeiRad wes den R
yforenfua farg o, et —

"G WfAT & AdER0 & forg srdes fEfoiRad Augvs B e W I@d g 9l UhR |

FHEUT SIS B YT & B8 A9 P 3@ & Hiok SRR g1 ol far g = |

7. S9d o | W 25 & e w), EfaRed fem uftrenfia fear sroem, srfq -

"25 (1) dfdgreR frEfaRed o & reged ofded URGD @Nd g, Wil BRI B, e &
FHUY PR Fhell & fdb HfIeTdR 7 —

() <fder & @ft @9 BRAE g B} 4 @,
(i) ST FIR & ATAR JAT fArd Icure fAarell uRga o @ &




248

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)

(i) Folvex A, OEH omded Ugd fHar T B @ |Aifd 9@ Sa 9fder & Age
daffed <Of & ey H 9Rtd e @ 99N IR | d9Ta THo-uF (TE S8 )
TRgd R far ©; den

(iv) 3Ied & UK & AT WR U B & w9 § N &R W Yb d19 HI AfdaT A &
THDE A ST PRaT & B

R el dd T GfAeT & Ael H, Al |iaar @ wEuer & fu afdeT ued o 9 15 fyaeR

TP Bl A B SR UK (HAT TAT 8, A1 WASTHR e DI UG & A9 UR Fidar IR Sl AR
B, ® o AT D AHDBE U BRI SHT BRI & oY & BT |

@
(3)

HAfaer @ fodl AN & & WY & forg HIE Y IS WEU IR ARG T B |
e T 3T & +iar §9doT SRy WIBR - $T AT TIRT BT | I BIs Fora gfra

T8I fpar SIrem g, o AHUel & fU arded, rded B W @ A QT B G|t W wigd fhar Tar || s
ST | |
Sad frEl #, e 55 H, Su-fm (3) #, wve (viii) @ @), fEfoRed wvs W faar Smom,
rerfq -

8.

10.

“(ix) STaaE drelierdr /@f el Ragd gR®, frT & sfa o # a1 e @ 59 fAfaa witgd
Al PR & ueT H WAl S B WIS & wY H AN S B ARMAS drell giengfa’ A
giergfar @1 g IR A1 wfongfer, SR o Rerfy &1, &1 i oRga aR 9dar & | AEY o [
Uee /|fAaT Bl Al ¥ AN B A B qde b foy der e

IR] 9El qarad “ARfBIe drel ufenfar ar rafefa @ gerr e ar rafengfa S fammr

% Sfd MY A AR S RS WA BT TS B, A WSl RIFA gRS BT FRwe a1 59 A
urd fHl Sl & uel § WA S e $ WU H RS dell I TR B S9
e & forg feed gRT S/ fBa1 ST Faar © | Aae S g uee /et /@il Rarad a1
3@ | ATT B8 A9 B de b foy d=1 s8R |7 |

Sad |t |, forag 56 | —

@)
(it)

(iii)

Iu—faH (5) H, "o Ufderd” vIel & WM W, "9I¢ 91 U e yfoRenfd fey ST,
I (6) @ W W, fforRad Su—fram uftRenfia faar s, srerfq—
“(6) <3 fafy (fafordl) wr srfeard wies /<wfder Wi /@ ok Wi faerr g e

T gaare [ # ofwre & fhwal @ A # fed 9o @ 9 § 9l 12 ufowa arfie <)
A =1 Aled YA gn:

W AR 3T, <@ Y & 99 R & fiaR yam ey o € @ e N e
AR 81 fhar e |
Su-fH (12) ¥, —
@) oraH faeme | R @ W W), Y Rg uforenfua far e
@) fFAfaRed wege @ SgE, s —

"R Tl 9 9 @il @ @99 B oy ge[ @1 18 Wil RAgd & Ame H
el w7 ¥ 5l fdg R @ ueer /dfdar /Rt R 3y 1y e H Ragd are gRT
ATl U T IR Bl WS AT @ AT & AR AT AIRS Sared &

A AT | ¥ T BN

Saq et #, 63 @ are, =ferRaa e x@r o, st —

"63%. ARPR §IRT THRTQ T ufayfel &1 IR e =er—

afe el |l IR W RaauRe & §9 WRER 993 & 9rd 9
BT 2, A WHR 9 F7El & i W & forw @i Ramd w= Ry v &3 & '
B Gl RIFA gR®I gRT Y {6y S drel a1fies famg der ufoyfd @1 <k R qen

SrfergferT @R et 21 |




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 249

1.

12.

13.
14.
15.

16.

S fEi H, | e4 H —

0]

(i)
(iii)

Iu—fem (1) @ e W, EfeRed Sufrem uferenfua fear Srom, srefq —

"(1) R feR @ R® B TR H -l 9 @it RAd oRE @ dE IWRER
JAST @ ATIH A DI IR A6l BT 8, a1 Wit Rarad oRE WA i /83 & T # feR
P WY H Hlder &R b &l UfART B aRrER A AT RH 63 B ATAR ARBR R ARG <,
S Y SIS BI, TR YA PR B UG QT

Iu—FM (3) § “Ufigit” s & e W, fRR wes gfoRenfua far e

Su-fm (6) #, ek dUT IR AT @ i\ yamara aiffel @ TRl @ WM W,
"IU—FRM (1) & i Jorm faftd a1 U9 &5 /9 & TR H SRR gN FRa de sifeRyfed
o, afs @1 8, 31 &%, 1 f SR 81 wes qr g uforenfia fey o,

Sad fHr |, fm 65 | —

0]

(i)

Iufm (2) & W R, f=feRad sufaw uftrenfia fear siroem, srerfq —

") =9 WAl H SEl ufgid @ IR 99 63 & o1l UEdRI & g WRER w7 A
ffad 78 @1 18 &, O gyt @ srgEa JIfY, A€ 9 @EE @AM § Fde] &) Bl 05
gfererd 3R /A7 = AWl (A4 Tl WA Bl BISHR) H Foldex & Pl Uh laerd &l I3 a7
gfergfcl &1 IR B &R, S 99 63 & AT WRBR R AYIT P T1Y, & SRER 847 |

I (6) @ wIH W, f=forRaa Su—fram uftRenfia foaar s, srerfq —

"(6) BT Ferdex NI SraIRT sifvaH ufogft @ AR Su-feW () & R s &
ST gfgfd @1 SrgHTIa IR S1fdd Aeprell SR &, O @il R OR®, deldex gRT AT
P R U QT & AiaR gfgfcd &1 sifrRer iR gqRea ST SHRaTg

e Aafe aifaa ufagfd @ TR \ReeR /ueeam gRT ugdl & 9 T 9 &H
RE Sl ©, < 31fde I gsg fad & iR S o B Sy | |

Sad At #, frm 71 #, Su—fm (6) &1 @ R fear ST |
Sad et |, W 71— &1 g R fear SIe |
S fEr #°, w77 |-

@)
(if)

U M (1) # 59 ufaerd” el & RIA W, CIe A1d ufaed’ ees gforenfud feu S,
U e (3) # uiw Ul weal @ XM WR, 1eTs ufaerd” vres ufoRenfyd fhy S |

Saa frEt H, e 81 #—

)

39 e (3) H-
@) oraH faeme 7 foge & W R, fage uforenfug faam o
@) FEAfaRed wRegd @M ST, Ui —

"R el dd 9 WSl & @Fd @ folg geE @1 T3 @il Rara & At 9,
el w7 & Bl fomg R @ ueer /wfder /Wi R Ry 1Y &3 d RIna are gRT
repret g Torr IRTHd | WS AFAITRT T AT S AFAR A 7RIS IATeT D

A 1 | fde T8 BN I
@) U s (5) #H—
() o H faeme ) foRe @ W R, fage uforenfug faar o

(iiy FFAfaRad wR=g® @ AT, AT —

IR 91, TS WIS AT VBT GIA Bl Ry U FHI B fhdl g W
BT IRIR H TP T8l B S, Fod @iTel TAT TARRd o $hlg I I1ud
TJHEHROT &AAT & O Q7 & 31t & IH®e SHes /I S | |




250 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)
17. oo i H, o os2 #, Su—fes (1) §—
@) w@vs (i) #-
() o femmE Y foRe @ W R, ¢ fagd gforenfua fasar Smoe
iy fFr=afoRaa wege A SgE, s —
"R Fed Wi/ AR Aol & fofg U @i e fofg e Arf 18
2, D UG D WE W U fFarier @ @ & fiav w18 W e vem T8 @ S
@)  wvs (i) #—
() o H femm ) faga & v W, fuge uforenfa far o
iy fFr=feaRed e <@ S, derfq —
IR 1) gells AT WHINT FIH & AMel H AJAMGT BRITOM ST Yguor =07
e | WRIMUAT & oy fFRIET YAM—u= / \edfd e drel 3 & UaTd Pl Sl | |
18. Sad frei # 99 101 § —
() Su—fT| (5) #, “104" 3BT & WM W, “102"" 3fd yfoRenfud fey S,
(i) Su-frm (7) @ 9., f=faRad Su—fem ST S, srerfq —
"(7%) I8l dTed # &1 g3 Wivrel, WIS URags U # iWfalRad wiier wR 4 e1fdd
YR ST ®, dF O &1t @it & uRags & 9 @it uRaed o & famr @f e & uRagd
& ®Y H qHST AT AT WS B O A B AR B FT A U GRS 98/ IRIET dRA
@ wY H 3ref T S qen 49 R & e 102 @ i dRars & forw i R
(i) Su—fT\ (8) #H, “104 3Bl & WM W, “102"" 3fh UfoRenfia fHy ST |
19. ad Al H, | 118 @ 918, F=iferRad e w@r g, e —
"118 &. FMl # & <1— TR e f{a # gl <Af a1 faxdl o/ f¥ &l /1% & @& forg
SfId W™ a1 Adhdl © A1 faRad # fforiRag dRol 9 371 P4l & {6 Suei &1 Iugadar |
A T Fha B
g SR e M 118 & oefi| & Ryarg wfe Rarra < § 78 & st - |
20. 9 Al H, UwY T T — | H -

() WA, wvs —7 H, —
@) ora#H faeme ¢ g & W R, ¢ foge uftrenfia fear sirgem:
@) ffaRed wegs @1 S, s —
"R A T ¥ WSl & T @ oy geM fby U uee & Aol | fhll W
H fH fIg R a9 uee W QU MU &3 4 yccHrl gR1 Malel Ty den jIkiema
Qe AT @ AT & AR A ATfie Saed @& diF A1 | 31 =18l
BRI
(i) W I, @S 3 H, SUwTs (@) § —
(@) “25 Uferd” Sl TT Ieq b WIF TR, “10 UfIL@” 3fd o e ufarenfad fag Sme;

(@) R H, “125/— TR TAT “156.25 /— HU" DI, fUET qAT Ukl B WA W, HH:
“110 /— SR TAT “121 /— T 3id, g qon veg gforenfid fey smo;

(i) W@Us 6 #, “10 Ul i AT Ieq B AN W, “¥AS A Ufera” vreg ufeenfua fdhg g
(v) @ve 7 @ WH |, F=faled @vs uforenfia faar smom, srrfq —
"7, < ol (falRr) W SEr wed /RIeiged W R @iel e g e qer
gar e # oferee @1 fhwdl & g d B o $1 g9 H§ ARy 12 ufied ufdy 9y @ )
A 1o Aied YIaEarg gr
g AR 7, < R & | T & AiaR A [Py o €, @ s A @rs
g9TRd &1 fehar S |
(v) @vs 28 #, 59 R vl @ UM W, “9I Ad ufaera’ e yfoRenfud fey ST,




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 251

(Vi) WRTV # @ve 7 & WH R, fFfalRaa @vs ufirenfua faar sroem, sieriq —
"7. Ul &I AAUU—

geel freiforRad el & Seelie afde URgd @< 8Y, Sl W BRI 8l, USC P

|HUYT R AHAT B {6 geemmy 7 -

() dee H O W BRIAE 9 PR 4 T

(i) ucer faorg & IrgHR JT U Icure fIarofl v o 41 B

(i) wover AN, R smdeT Uvqd far AT B, @ GG 9% Sad Uee & AGQ Wl
dffed <3 & T | R Rid @ TR ISR | Sqra] JHo—ud (TF S /)
T ax far 7 e

(iv) oded @ UG & T TR ST B & w9 § AR &) R TP A9 B AR
qIeh & qHBE IR STHT PRAT < &

R & T @A P AMS H, AT g b FHUY & AN srdeT UM S
A 15 RITwR TP $I 3@ & AR YA [HAT AT 8, T USSR e Bl i
T FHY WR I AN B AAR WIeH, S AR Bl, b AHDE U B SH BRI
& forg =l g,

(v) uec & Bl 9FT &3 & Fwdv & forg B W1 SIS U”UT &R AR FE BN,

(vi) ficee 9 T & iR FHY0T o RY WIHR B & AR IR BT | AT iy
ol gfea € fear Srar &, 9 g9uer & oy e, e @l WRfd @l A
fos1 @ I o widpd fbar T || S | |

21,  ad fgHl |, uwu w1 H, -
() AT, wWue—7 "
(@) o H, faemme 1 g @ e W, v forge wfoenfoa fear o,
@) fFEAfaRed wege @ S, s —

"R A T W WSl $ WA $ [ USH @1 T8 Afda] & AWl d fhdl
# fodt fig w @ dfder R Ry v a3 # dfderar gr1 e U den algd @
QS AT @9 AT & AFAR 3N AIRND IdTed & o 1 | 3fferd T8I

BRI
(i)  WmT o H~
@) W1 & WA R, F=faRaa @oe uforenfa fasar s, srerfq —
“1.  qd fe=mr

WAIRTPR 99 62 & AR I §RT RN Tl &3 & 7Y fhmm &1 Jas & |7,
@) w1 @ qre, fEfoRad Qe war S, S —
“19%  faer Il
.......... S0y ufd 99 @ &) W fnft el /Aol # ura @ g STaaR drelt
fagrer gRT iam arg IR aiffe wfve i a9 Smedt | ufoarht del /e
B YR R URMS T I AquRa aiffie Afder Il o R yded 9 99 & <I1d
% ol B WR 10 YRR &1 &R W F I8 Sy |
- afe aifffe dfaer IR @ RS sraeRa Ifdr 100 /-9 B, 1 I AT 9§ B
UR™ & 1T 110 /— ®UU d7 Add 94 & URS & ARl 121/— ®9d db el ol
ST eI 3rTel U i ¥ & i & oI sl YR deTs e |7;
(M US4 H, 10 YRR 3fd TAT Wk b WM W, “Wig A UReT’ v uicrenfua fby
SIS,
@) W@vs 5 & WH R, fFrefoRad @vs uftrenfua fear Srg, srefq —
5, < fafy (fofel) w wfaer ol /orges /@M iR @it e g oo
qn gar e # ofReE @l fhwdl @ gae H B ge B aem H IR 12 fiw
qIies B X W TS Aled YIAEArg Bl




252

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)

(iii)

Ry AT 7, <@ [y ([GRe) & 9@ fa & fdR yaE fdy o €, @1 e 0
TS yHTRE el fbar ST |
(S) wue 26 #H, “10 UREIA” 3 dAT T’ & WATH WX, “H|I¢ AT U’ e yfoRenfud oy
ST
ATV H, @ve 7 & @IF R, frefoRad @vs uftrenfua faar Sirgem, ereriq —
"7 dfaeer frEfaRed o & s omded U $Rd gy, W Al BROT 8l wfaar
BT GO B FHdl § b AR 9 —
0) <ifaer # 9 W PRI 95 R 4 §;
(i) T IR & JFAR JAT AUERT e fJaroll ugd aR o &

(i) wover A, rAH emdeT URgd A T 2, @ 9EIfd 9@ Ha 9fder & Age a
dffed <Of & ey H 9Rtad e @ 99N IR | d9Ta TEo-ua (T S8 )
T o far 7 qen

(iv) oTmded @ TR & G W UG B & w9 H AN &% W UH A DI Gfaar IR b
SEEZENINECCINCACINCUES

W 4l dl @A dfderer @ "ol d, dfe wfder & wqder & oy smded
T SF W 15 RIaRR 9@ @1 af & IR WA fhar T 7, 91 GIeER SmaeT &
YA & FHY R AT IR S AL B, B & AN b GHGE AT BIE SHl PRI D
ferg Y 8,

(v) <faer & fH=ft 9RT &= & |Eder & forg B8 W1 SIS TRVl R IRy FEl BN

(Vi) e 9 e & WidR FAY0 SRy TSR B &1 37 UIRd S| afe &g Aoty
Jud &1 fear S 8, dr qHuer & oY arded, deT B UK Bl drg e @1 g
IR iepd fhar AT FHS S | |

22,  Sod El |, gwu w9 ta—1 §, —

@)

(i)

(iii)

AT || H, Woe—7 #H—
@) ora#H faeme 1 e @ e v, fage gforenfua fasar simee;
@) fFEfaRed wege @ S, s —

IR A I ¥ GGl @ W By MY RAT &AM H, {6 wwy 7 el fag
WR Td dfder R Ry U &= #§ dfierer g’ el U den IRgd §d afe
AT T I & AFAR AT ARIS IATGH B O AT F 31ed T8l sFm |7

AT 111 H—
@) Wvs 1 & WH R, F=falaq @vs uftrenfua fdar Sirgem, s —

“1.  qd fo=mE
RiE gR® 9 62 & ATAR I RT AN & & folg f1w &1 wrams
W';
@) w1 @ qre, fHfaRad Qe war S, st —
“1%. WRfAC IR :

.......... PR I e W Ul diell A H ur @ TS SoedR 9ol Afderer
ERT ARG IR aiffe wfder R 99 el | ufoanft arell /Sar & SR
W YRS w9 I ARG df¥es RHFS R B R I A9 9 & A b gl
B9 TR 10 U9 B R | §QIS SIeT |

R — A 9Ifffe WRfAe Ay A uRfRIE senlRa Ifdr 100 /— w9 8, A I8 A a9 B
UR™ & 1T 110 /— ®UU d7 Add 94 & URS & A1eT 121,/— ®9d db el ol
ST qAT 3Tl Uhd oI dY & sflh & ol 31 YbR d@Ts ST |7;

g 4 ¥, “T9 YfAerd” vl & W W, “ie 1 gfaea” wsg gforenfod fhy S




HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 253

23.

(iv)

v)
(vi)

rerfq -

24.

wrg 5 & M W, AfRad @re gforenfd fasar S, srerfq —

"'5
)

<7 fafr (f@fert) w wfve IRt /Iorges / @F &R @fe e g9 v g

gar [ H e @l fewi & A # {6l g @1 e H AR 12 ufiwd afie B ) 9

CHIG I RN JIdr=aryg 2rfl

wReg AT <9, <7 [y & 91d 9 & iR grae by S € @ 318 A et yWiRka 7@
fopar Se |

TUs 25 ¥,

“10 yfaera” 3fh Tl Teq & WM W, “HIe AT gfaera” g gforenfod by S

IRV H, @t 7 & wH W, fFrefalRad @ve uforenfid fear smoem, seifq —
"7, WA WRMAT BT FHI:

RiteeRe FFfaRad ek & oteaedi| amdes URgd d_d gY, Sl 1 HRUT B, faar

BT FHUTT B AhdT © b dfdgrdr 7 —

i)
(i)
(i)

(vi)

wRfFe § T @ SRR 91 R 9
R PRR & AR JAT AR Ieared fIavol uga &= <1 &
Fetver 7, RTaH e URgd far /1 &, & WA O o RS & 7aq
wf dffed <O & W W GEtad el & TR SRS | dara] JHTo—ud
(G S ) Tga a3 B der
e B T & T W IWAIST B & w9 H AN &R R T 79 $ WA
IR & e AR AT HRaT &

WReg T4l T WA WMAT $ Ael W, dfe Wider $ Wi & fog smde
T S W 15 RITRR IF &I 3@ & SR1E WA fbar 11 B, a1 |iAeeR smdeT

D UK D GHI UR G A DI AfJET IR, S AL B, D GHbE AUy B
ST R @ fory SRt 8,

RMAC & 91T &85 & GG & foIU B AT 3Mded TS HI4 A 81 BT,

fcee T T & iR F9dY IR WER &R &7 e 9IRd dm | Aafk &g
ol Jfea &1 foar Srar €, @ |Ruor & oy arded, sfded @ Ujfd & o e
B AN IR Wiy fhar a1 qHST SIQ | |

Sad ot § gwu T N -2 # wus 3 @ e R, AEfaRaa wvs uforenfoq fear siem,

“3, <y fafor (ffrl) W wffe IR/ @M iR wiel e g emue qen gaare e 4

3feraT @I fedl & YA H A g @ g=n # AR 12 wferd a1 ) @ @S dfd gy
BT

g Al <u, <9 fARRl & 9a 9 & fiar yrae fey S 2, @ e W = yiRa

&l faar Sg
IF A, gwd U1 1S UH—2 ¥, WS 9 b WM W, F=falad @vs ufcrRenfua fam Siee, s —

"9 XIOged P IS R UAS 9¥ UUW e dd I H A @l e | <u fafyy
(fferm) wm wRfFe ¥, @M R @S e g7 roe den gqard [fe # siveE @ fowdl &

A H B g @ aem H IR 12 iR afie &) ¥ 1ol |afed gy sl

g Ife <u, <7 fafY & 9d 9 & fiar a9 & @ a8 o sare wRa T8

o o | |

ﬁO@ow,
3R J&I Afd, BRATIN ARBR,
G el qfaer faumT |



254 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)

[Authorised English Trandation]

HARYANA GOVERNMENT
MINES AND GEOLOGY DEPARTMENT
Notification
The 3rd May, 2021

No. S.0. 22/C.A. 67/1957/Ss. 15 and 23C/2021.— In exercise of the powers conferred by sub-section (1) of
section 15 and section 23C of the Mines and Mineras (Development and Regulation) Act, 1957, the Governor of
Haryana hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Haryana Minor Mineral Concession, Stocking,
Transportation of Minerals and Prevention of Illegal Mining Rules, 2012, namely: —

1 (1) These rules may be caled the Haryana Minor Mineral Concession, Stocking, Transportation of
Minerals and Prevention of Illegal Mining (Amendment) Rules, 2021.

(2)  Theserules shal comeinto force from the date of their publication in the official gazette.

2. In the Haryana Minor Mineral Concession, Stocking, Transportation of Minerals and Prevention of Illegal
Mining Rules, 2012 (hereinafter called the said rules), inrule 9, in sub-rule (3),—

(i) for the figure and sign“25%”, the figure and sign “10%” shall be substituted;

(ii)  inthe Explanation, for the word, figure and sign “Rs. 125/-" and “Rs.156.25", the word, figure and sign
“Rs. 110/-"and “Rs.121/-" shall respectively be substituted.

3. In the said rules, inrule 18, after the word “thereof” existing at the end, the following words and sign shall be
added, namely “through Registered post and /or e-mail, whichever is earlier”.
4, In the said rules, for rule 20, the following rules shall be substituted, namely:-

“20 (1). A lease holder may seek surrender of lease, for whatsoever reasons, by submitting an application
subject to the condition that the |essee:-

0) has stopped all mining operationsin the lease;

(if)  hasfurnished production returns as required i n terms of the lease deed;

(iii)  has submitted the No Dues Certificate(NDC) from the officer-in-charge of the district concerned

with regards to all pending dues on account of the said lease, till the end of calendar month in
which application is submitted; and

(iv)  has deposited an amount equa to one-month dead rent at the rate as may be applicable as
non-refundable fee, at the time of submission of application:

Provided that in case of riverbed mining, if the application for surrender of lease is
submitted during the period from 1st June to 15th September, then the lease holder shall be
liable to deposit the non-refundable fee equal to two months of dead rent as may be applicable,
at the time of submission of application.

(2)  No application for surrenders of part area of the lease shall be maintainable.

(3)  The Director shall pass an order accepting the surrender request within thirty days. In case no decision
is communicated, the application for surrender shall be deemed to have been accepted on expiry of thirty days of
submission of application.”.

5. Insaid rules, in rule 22 in sub-rule (2), for the words “twenty five” the word “ten” shall be substituted.

6. In said rules, in rule 24 in sub-rule (1), for words “The application for renewal of a mining contract shall be
decided on satisfaction of the competent authority with regard to the following” the words “An application for
renewal of a mining contract shall be decided by the Government within a period of six months of the receipt of
complete application in all respects keeping in view the following parameters’ shall be substituted.
7. Inthe said rules, for rule 25, the following rule shall be substituted, namely:-
“25(1). The contractor may seek surrender of contract for whatsoever reasons, by submitting an application
subject to the condition that the contractor:
) has stopped all mining operationsin the contract;
(ii)  hasfurnished production returns as required in terms of the contract agreement;
(iii)  has submitted the No Dues Certificate (NDC) from the officer-in-charge of the district
concerned with regards to all pending dues on account of the said contract, till the end of
calendar month in which application is submitted; and



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 255

(iv)  hasdeposited an amount equal to one-month contract money at the rate as may be applicable, at
the time of submission of application as non-refundable fee:

Provided that in case of riverbed mining contractor, if the application for surrender of
contract is submitted during the period from 1st June to 15th September, then the contractor
shall be liable to deposit the non-refundable fee equal to two months of contract money as may
be applicable, at the time of submission of application.

(2)  No application for surrenders of part area of the contract shall be maintainable.
(3)  The Director shall pass orders accepting the surrender request within thirty days. In case no decisionis

communicated the application for surrender shall be deemed to have been accepted on expiry of thirty days of
submission of application.

8.

10.

11

Inthe said rules, in rule 55, in sub-rule (3), after clause (viii), the following clause shall be added, namely:-

“(ix) The highest bidder/ mineral concession holder may furnish the amount of ‘Initial bid security’ or
‘balance amount of security or security deposit’, as the case may be, by depositing the amount in the
appropriate head of the department or in the form of a Fixed Deposit Receipt in favour of the Director or any
officer authorised in this behalf. The Fixed Deposit Receipt shall be valid for a period of six months beyond
the period of lease/ contract:

Provided that where the aforesaid ‘Initial bid security’ or ‘balance amount of security’ or ‘security
deposit’ is submitted by depositing the amount in the appropriate head of the department, the mineral
concession holder may be alowed by the Director, to replace the same by furnishing the “Initial bid security”
in the form of a Fixed Deposit Receipt in favour of the Director or any officer authorised in this behalf. The
Fixed Deposit Receipt shall be valid for a period of six months beyond the period of lease/ contract/mineral
concession.”

Inthe said rules, in rule 56,—

0) in the sub-rule (5), for the words “ten percent”, the words “seven and a half percent” shall be
substituted.

(ii)  for sub-rule (6), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(6) In case of any default in payment of the instalments of dead rent/ contract money/
contribution to the ‘Mines and Minerals Development, Restoration and Rehabilitation Fund’ on the due
date(s), the amount would be payable along with interest at the rate of 12 % per annum:

Provided that in case the dues are paid within 7 days of the due date no interest shall be
charged.”
(ii1) insub-rule (12),-
(@  forthesign“.” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted;
(b)  thefollowing proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that in case of mineral concession granted for mining of minerals from the
riverbed, total mineral excavated and stacked by the concession holder within the area granted
on mining lease/ contract/ permit at any point in time shall not exceed three times of the average
monthly production as per approved mining plan.

In the said rules, after rule 63, following rule shall be inserted, namely:-

“63A. Fixation of annual rent and compensation by Government.— In case where no agreement is
reached by way of mutual settlement between land owner and mineral concession holder, the Government may
fix and notify the rate of annual rent and compensation, to be paid by the mineral concession holders to the
landowners for area granted on mineral concession for mining under theserules.”.

Inthe said rules, in rule 64,-
(i for sub-rule (1), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Where no agreement is reached by way of mutual settlement between the landowner and the
mineral concession holder regarding the rate of rent, the mineral concession holder shall offer to pay an
amount equal to two percent of the Collector rate or at such rate as may be notified by the Government
as per rule 63A in respect of such land /area, whichever is higher, asrent.”

(i)  insub-rule(3), for the word “ compensation”, the word “rent” shall be substituted.

(iii)  in sub—rule (6), for the words and sign “of annuity payable under the R&R Policy” the words and sign
“as prescribed under sub-rule (1) or rate of rent fixed and notified, if any, by the Government in respect
of such area/ land, whichever is higher”, shall be substituted.



256 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)
12.  Inthesadrules, inrule 65,-

(i) for sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely: - “In cases where the amount of
compensation is not mutually settled between the parties under rule 63, the tentative amount of
compensation shall be equal to an amount 0.5 % of the collector rate in case of riverbed mining and/
or 1% of collector rate in all other cases (except Riverbed mining) or at the rate of an amount of
compensation, as notified by the Government under rule 63 A, whichever is higher.”.

(i) for sub-rule (6), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(6) Where the amount of final compensation determined by the Collector works out to be more than
the tentative amount of compensation already deposited as per sub-rule (2), the mineral concession
holder shall deposit immediately on demand by the Collector, the additional amount of compensation
within fifteen days:

Provided that in case the amount of final compensation works out to be less than the amount
aready deposited by the contractor/ lessee, the excess amount shall be refunded to him within fifteen
days.”.

13. Inthesaidrules, inrule 71, sub-rule 6 shall be omitted.
14. Inthesaid rules, rule 71-A shall be omitted.
15. Inthesaidrules, inrule 77, in sub—rule (1),
(i) for the words “ten percent” the words “seven and half percent” shall be substituted.
(ii)  insub-rule (3), for the word “five percent”, the words “two and half percent” shall be substituted.
16. Inthesaidrules,inrule81,-

(i) in sub-rule (3) for thesign “.” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted;

(ii)  thefollowing proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided that in case of mineral concession granted for mining of minerals from riverbed, total
mineral excavated and stacked by the concession holder within the area granted on mining lease/
contract/ permit shall not exceed three times of the average monthly production as per approved mining
plan at any pointintime.”.

(iii)  insub-rule (5),—

(@  forthesign“.” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted;
(b)  thefollowing proviso shall be added, namely:—
“Provided that no sand washing plant or screening plant shall stock, within the said premises at
any given point of time, the raw mineral and processed aggregate put together which is equal to
more than thirty days installed processing capacity of the unit.”
17. Inthesaidrules, inrule 82 in sub-rule (1),—
(@ inclause (i),—
0) for thesign“;” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted;
(ii)  thefollowing proviso shall be added, namely:-
“Provided that for raw mineral/ unprocessed mineral, no licences shall be granted within
adistance of five kilometre from the site of source of such mineral for which licenceis sought.”
(b)  inclause (iii),- for thesign “.” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted;
(ii) thefollowing proviso shall be inserted, namely:—
“Provided that in case of a sand washing or a screening plant, licence shall be granted to
the applicant having NOC/ Consent to Establish from the Haryana State Pollution Control

Board.”.

18. Inthesaidrules, inrule 101,-

) in sub-rule (5), for figure ‘104’ the figure' 102’ , shall be substituted.
(ii)  after sub-rule (7) the following sub-rule shall be added, namely:-

“(7A) Where the mineral loaded in the carrier isfound to be more than mineral weight recorded
in the mineral transit pass transportation of such excess mineral shall be treated as transportation of
mineral without avalid mineral transit pass and shall be construed to be carrying/ transporting the such
quantity of mineral illegally obtained and shall be liable for action under rule 102 of these rules.”;

(iif)  Insub-rule (8), for the figure ‘104’ the figure * 102’ shall be substituted.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 257

19.

20.

Inthe said rules, after rule 118, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:-

“118A. Relaxation of rules.— The Government may make an appropriate scheme for waiving off any

dues or any other amount in public interest or may relax the applicability of any of the provision of these rules
by recording reason in writing:

Provided that above relaxation shall not be given for granting mineral concession except as under

rule 118.”.

Inthe said rules, in Form ML-1,—

0]

(i)

(iii)
(iv)

v)
(vi)

inPart I1, in clause 7,—
(@  forthesign“.” existing at the end the sign “:” shall be substituted;
(b)  thefollowing proviso shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that in case of lease granted for mining of minerals from the riverbed, total
mineral excavated and stacked by the lease holder, within the area granted on mining lease, at
any point in time shall not exceed three times of the average monthly production as per
approved mining plan.” .

inpart 111, in clause 3, in sub clause (b),—
(@  fortheword and sign “25%", the word and sign “10%" shall be substituted,;

(b) in the Explanation, the word and sign “Rs.125/-" and “Rs.156.25", the word and sign
“Rs. 110/-" and “Rs.121/-" shall be substituted respectively;

inPart I, in clause 6, for the word and sign “10%”, the word and sign “7.5%" shall be substitute;
in Part 111, for clause 7, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“In case of any default in payment of the instalments of dead rent /royalty/ contribution to the ‘Mines
and Minerals Development, Restoration and Rehabilitation Fund’ on the due date(s), the amount shall
be payable along with interest at the rate of twelve percent per annum:

Provided that in case the dues are paid within seven days of the due date(s) no interest shall be
charged.”.

in clause 28, for the word and sign “10%", the word and sign “ 7.5%" shall be substituted.
in Part V, for clause 7, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“7.  Surrender of mining lease.—

The lessee may seek surrender of lease, for whatsoever reasons, by submitting an
application subject to the condition that the lessee:-

Q) has stopped all mining operationsin the lease;
(i) hasfurnished production returns as required in terms of the lease deed;

(iii)  has submitted the No Dues Certificate (NDC) from the officer-in-charge of the district
concerned with regard to all pending dues on account of the said lease, till the end of
calendar month in which application is submitted; and

(iv)  hasdeposited an amount equal to one-month dead rent at the rate as may be applicable, at
the time of submission of application as non-refundable fee:

Provided that in case of riverbed mining, if the application for surrender of lease is
submitted during the period from 1st June to 15th September, then the lease holder shall
be liable to deposit the non-refundable fee equal to two months of dead rent as may be
applicable, at the time of submission of application.

(v)  Noapplication for surrender of part area of the lease shall be maintainable.

(vi) the Director shall pass orders accepting the surrender request within thirty days. In case
no decision is communicated the application for surrender shall be deemed to have been
accepted on expiry of thirty days of submission of application.”.



258

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)

21. Inthesaidrules, in Form MC-1,-

0]

(i)

(iii)

inPart 1, in clause 7,-
(@  forthesign“.” existing at the end, the sign “:” shall be substituted;
(b)  Thefollowing proviso shall be added, namely:—

“Provided that in case of contract granted for mining of minerals from the riverbed, total
mineral excavated and stacked by the contractor, within the area granted on mining contract, at
any point in time shall not exceed three times of the average monthly production as per approved
mining plan.”.

inPart 111,
(@  for clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“1.  Surfacerent:
The contractor shall pay rent for the surface area occupied by him as per rule 62.”
(b)  after clause 1, following clause shall be inserted, namely:-
“1A. Contract money:

The highest bid received in the competitive bidding/auction at the rate of
[ S per annum shall become the ‘annual contract money’ amount
payable by the contractor. The rate of annual contract money initially determined on the
basis of the competitive bids/auctions shall be increased @ 10% on completion of each
block of three years.

Explanation.— If the initially determined amount of annual contract money is
Rs. 100/, it shall be increased to Rs. 110/- with the commencement of
the fourth year and to Rs. 121/- with the commencement of the
7th year and so on and so forth for the next each block of three years.”
(c) inclause 4, theword and sign “10%", the word and sign “7.5%" shall be substituted.
(d)  for clause 5, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“5.  In case of any default in payment of the instalments of the contract money/royalty/
contribution to the ‘Mines and Minerals Development, Restoration and Rehabilitation Fund’ on
the due date(s), the amount would be payable aong with interest at the rate of 12 percent per
annum:
Provided that in case the dues are paid within 7 days of the due date(s) no interest shall be
charged.”.
(e)  inclause 26, the word and sign “10%" the word and sign “7.5%” shall be substituted;
in Part V, for clause 7, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“7.  The contractor may seek surrender of contract for whatsoever reasons, by submitting an
application subject to the condition that the contractor:

() has stopped all mining operationsin the contract;
(i)  hasfurnished production returns as required in terms of the contract agreement;

(iii)  has submitted the No Dues Certificate (NDC) from the officer-in-charge of the district
concerned with regard to al pending dues on account of the said contract, till the end of
calendar month in which application is submitted; and

(iv)  has deposited an amount equal to one-month contract money at the rate as may be
applicable, at the time of submission of application as non-refundable fee:

Provided that in case of riverbed mining contractor, if the application for
surrender of contract is submitted during the period from 1st June to 15th September,
then the contractor shall be liable to deposit the non-refundable fee equal to two months
of contract money as may be applicable, at the time of submission of application.

(v)  Noapplication for surrenders of part area of the contract shall be maintainable;

(vi)  The Director shall pass orders accepting the surrender request within thirty days. In case
no decision is communicated the application for surrender shall be deemed to have been
accepted on expiry of thirty days of submission of application.”.



HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA) 259

22.  Inthesadrules, in Form MPS-1,—

inPart Il, in clause 7,—

for thesign “.” existing at the end, the sign”:” shall be substituted;
The following proviso shall be added, namely:-

“Provided that in case of permit granted for mining of minerals from the riverbed, total mineral
excavated and stacked by the contractor, within the area granted on mining permit , at any point
in time shall not exceed three times of the average monthly production as per approved mining

0]

(i)

(iii)
(iv)

v)
(vi)

@
(b)

plan.”
inPart I,
@

“1.
(b)

for clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

Surface rent:
The permit holder shall pay rent for the surface area occupied by him as per rule 62.”

after clause 1, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
“1A. Permit money:

The highest bid received in the competitive bidding/auction at the rate of Rs. ............
per annum shall become the ‘annual permit money’ amount payable by the contractor.
The rate of annual permit money initially determined on the basis of competitive bids/
auctions shall be increased @10% on completion on each block of three years.

Explanation.— If the initially determined amount of annual permit money is Rs.100/—,
it shall be increased to Rs. 110/- with the commencement of the fourth
year and to Rs. 121/- with the commencement of the 7th year and so on
and so forth for the next each block of three years.”

in clause 4, the word and sign “10%", the word and sign “7.5%" shall be substituted,;
for clause 5, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
Interest on delayed payment:

“5. In case of any default in payment of the instalments of permit money/royalty contribution to the
‘Mines and Minerals Development, Restoration and Rehabilitation Fund’ on the due date(s), the
amount would be payable along with interest at the rate of 12 percent per annum:

Provided that in case the dues are paid within seven days of the due date(s) no interest shall be
charged.”

in clause 25, for the word and sign “10%", the word and sign “7.5%" shall be substituted.
in Part V, for clause 7, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-
Surrender of mining permit:

“7.

The permit holder may seek surrender of permit, for whatsoever reasons, by submitting

an application subject to the condition that the permit holder:

(i)
(if)
(iii)

(iv)

v)
(vi)

has stopped all mining operationsin the permit area ;
has furnished production returns as required in terms of the permit agreement ;

has submitted the No Dues Certificate (NDC) from the officer-in-charge of the district
concerned with regards to all pending dues on account of the said permit, till the end of
calendar month in which application is submitted; and

has deposited an amount equal to one-month permit fee at the rate as may be applicable,
at the time of submission of application as non-refundable fee:

Provided that, in case of riverbed mining, if the application for surrender of permit
is submitted during the period from 1st June to 15th September, then the permit holder
shall be liable to deposit the non-refundable fee equal to two months of permit fee as may
be applicable, at the time of submission of application.

No application for surrender of part area of the permit shall be maintainable.

The Director shall pass orders accepting the surrender request within thirty days. In case
no decision is communicated the application for surrender shall be deemed to have been
accepted on expiry of thirty days of submission of application.”



260

HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.), MAY 3, 2021 (VYSK. 13,1943 SAKA)

23.

24.

Inthe said rules, in Form MPS-2, for clause 3, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“3.  Incase of any default in payment of the instalments of permit money/ contribution to the ‘Mines and
Minerals Development, Restoration and Rehabilitation Fund’ on the due date(s), the amount would be payable
along with interest at the rate of twelve percent per annum:

Provided that in case the dues are paid within seven days of the due date(s) no interest shall be
charged.”

Inthe said rules, in Form PIM -2, for clause 9, the following clause shall be substituted, namely:-

“9.  Theannual amount of royalty shall be paid in advance by 1st April of every year. In case of any default
in payment of the instalments of permit money/ contribution to the ‘Mines and Minerals Development,
Restoration and Rehabilitation Fund’ on the due date(s), the amount would be payable along with interest at
the rate of twelve percent per annum:

Provided that in case the dues are paid within seven days of the due date(s) no interest shall be
charged.”.

T. C. GUPTA,
Additional Chief Secretary to Government Haryana,
Mines and Geology Department.

9164—L.R—H.G.P., PkI.



